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HISTORICAL Soci-
ety Meeting, Satur-
day, March 8, 2 p.m., 
Historical Museum. 
Program: Lucy Mor-
rison Moore: Early 
Years of a Lady of 
Legend” presented by 
Terri Lynn Geissinger, 
Great-Granddaugh-
ter of Lucy. Everyone 
welcome. Refresh-
ments. 921-1551 or 
864-2678.

Personals
THE content of any 
advertisement in this 
newspaper is the sole 
responsibility of the 
advertiser. The Inde-
pendent Record does 
not endorse, encour-
age or promote the 
purchase or sale of 
any product, service, 
company or individ-
ual who advertises 
in the Independent 
Record.

86% of Wyoming 
adults c i te local 
newspapers and their 
websites, as their 
most trusted source 
for public notices ver-
sus government and 
related sources. Wy-
oming citizens can 
monitor the actions 
of their local govern-
ments from hearings, 
minutes, salaries, 
bids, elections, zon-
ing, foreclosures and 
so much more! You 
can search all public 
notices printed and 
posted statewide with 
Wyoming community 
newspapers, in one 
place, online for free 
at wyopublicnotices.
com.	

NARCOTICS Anon-
ymous meetings are 
held every Tuesday 
and Saturday, 7 p.m., 
at the Water Treat-
ment Cottage, 1020 
S. 6th. Call 921-0880 
for information.	  

A L C O H O L I C S 
Anonymous meeting 
schedule. We are 
here to help guide 
and support you. All 
meetings are held 
at the Water Treat-
ment Cottage located 
at 1020 S. 6th St.,  
Wed., 7 p.m.-open 
discussion; Fri., 7 
p.m.-closed book 
study; Closed book 
discussions are Sat., 
10 a.m., 141 Pioneer 
Home Dr., west end 
basement library.	

AL-ANON. When 
you don’t know where 
to turn because 
someone drinks too 
much, Al-Anon Fam-
ily Groups can help! 
Join us on Thurs-
days, 6 p.m., in the 
Community Church 
basement, located 
at 244 N. 6th Street.

BLOOD Drive for 
Thermopolis Com-
munity at the Senior 
Center on Monday, 
March 3, 2 p.m. to 
6 p.m. and Tuesday, 
March 4, 9 a.m. to 
1 p.m. To make an 
appointment call Me-
lene Mierzejewski at 
307-240-1414 or go to 
vitalant.org. 

 	
Services 	

YOU can say a lot 
in only 25 words! 
Reach thousands of 
readers with a sin-
gle classified when  
placed in WYCAN 
(Wyoming Classified 
Ad Network). You can 
sell, buy, promote 
your services and so 
much more for only 
$150. Contact the 
Independent Record, 
864-2328 or ads@
thermopir.com for 
more info on a WY-
CAN ad in Wyoming 
newspapers. Best 
statewide coverage 
around!

SEARCH  Wyoming 
Public Notices at: 
www.wyopublicno-
tices.com. This online 
service is provided to 
you free by your local 
newspapers, includ-
ing the Thermopolis 
Independent Record. 
You’ll easily find all 
public notices printed 
in Wyoming commu-
nity newspapers on 
this statewide digital 
repository. Stay in the 
know about your gov-
ernment. Minutes, 
salaries, spending, 
bids, taxes, fore-
closures, hearings, 
schools, assess-
ments, budgets, and 
much more! www.
wyopublicnotices.
com.

WELCOME Ralan-
ya Cole to A Cut 
Above Salon! She is 
now taking hair ap-
pointments for cuts, 
color, foils, ombres 
and so much more. 
To schedule an ap-
pointment, call 864-
9355 or online at 
thermopacutabove.
mysalononline.com 	
	

Miscellaneous       
DO you need bundles 
of old newspapers? 
These are great for 
fire starters, pack-
ing, arts and crafts, 
gardening and can 
be used for so much 
more. Stop by the 
Independent Record 
office, at 431 Broad-
way during our nor-
mal office hours on 
Mon.-Thurs., 8:30 
a.m. - 5 p.m. News-
paper bundles are 
free, first come, first 
served.   

DINNER special at 
Safari Club: Barbe-
que ribs, choice of 
potato, soup or salad. 
$14.99

 HOT Springs County 
Moms for Liberty has 
invited your School 
Board members to 
meet the community 
at the Hot Springs 
County Library, 5 - 6 
p.m. on Thursday, 
Feb. 27.

Employment
WYOMING Whis-
key Bottling in Kirby, 
Wyo., is hiring part 
time on-call staff. 
Successful candi-
dates must be 21 
years +, able to lift a 
minimum 20 lbs re-
peatedly, and be de-
tail oriented.  Will train 
the right person(s).  
Positions start at $18/
hr, typically working 
12-18 hours per week. 
Submit questions 
and/or applications 
to Christopher.Lo-
pez@Edrington.com 
or drop off at the 
Wyoming Whiskey 
Shop in Kirby. 

POSITIONS open at 
NW BOCES.  Training 
provided. Compet-
itive wages start-
ing at $16.50/hour. 
Opportunity for ad-
vancement.  Benefits 
package.  A variety of 
shifts available (after-
noon, evenings, over-
night, weekends, and 
school days). Work 
with K-8th grade 
youth in a school 
and residential set-
ting. NW BOCES 
has been serving  
students for 50+ 
years. Join our team 
to help make a dif-
ference in the lives 
youth. Applications 
available at 250 E. 
Arapahoe or at www.
nwboces.com.  Must 
be at least 21 years 
old, have a diploma 
or GED, and pass 
background checks. 
Call 864-2171 for 
more info.

CERTIFIED K-6/5-8 
and/or Special Edu-
cation Teacher po-
sition open at NW 
BOCES/Big Horn 
Basin Chi ldren’s 
Center in Thermop-
olis.  Students K-8. 
Join an educational 
and treatment team 
providing high-qual-
ity instruction and 
therapy services to 
youth ages 5-14. 
Engage students to 
promote their so-
cial, emotional, and 
academic develop-
ment. Collaborate 
with team members 
to provide positive 
reinforcement within 
an individualized ed-
ucation plan (IEP). 
Enjoy small class 
size with full-time 
paraeducator sup-
port. Join our team to 
make a difference in 
the lives of youth we 
serve. Competitive 
salary and benefits 
package. For more 
info: call 864-2171 
or check our website 
www.nwboces.com.

JOIN our team. We 
are looking for team 
oriented caregivers at 
Big Horn Enterprise. 
There are a variety 
of hours available. 
Starts at $14 per hour. 
Residential shifts re-
ceive 5% shift differ-
ential pay. Additional 
increase in wage 
after 3 months and 
1 year with a suc-
cessful evaluation. 
$500 signing bo-
nus with  successful 
background check. 
Stop by and pick up 
an application at 641 
Warren St., Thermo-
polis.

THE Tepee Pools 
is now  accepting 
applications for the 
position of lifeguard. 
Stop by to apply at 
144 Tepee Street, Hot 
Springs State Park.

BLACKETER Estate 
Sale, 732 Arapahoe 
St. on Fri., Feb. 28, 
9 a.m. - 4 p.m. and  
Sat., March 1, 9 a.m. 
- 3 p.m.	  

For Sale 	
DINNER special at 
Safari Club: Barbe-
que ribs, choice of 
potato, soup or salad. 
$14.99 

HA ZEL - n - Pear l s 
will be open the first 
Thursday, Friday and 
Saturday of every 
month, 10 a.m.-5  
p.m. 	
	
	

Pets
D’S Dog Shop. 1004 
Shoshoni. 864-3141. 
Call today for all 
your pup’s grooming 
needs.	

IN-HOME Pet Sit-
ting in Thermopolis! 
Countryside Groom-
ing & Boarding with 
decades of experi-
ence caring for your 
pets is Insured, back-
ground checked, 
and Pet First Aid & 
CPR certified. Call 
us at 921-9324 or 
431-8336! Your furry 
friends deserve the 
best!	

Vehicles
PAYING for unpre-
pared iron. Buying 
junk cars. Will pick up. 
Selling quality used 
cars and trucks. Call 
us today at Pete Smet 
Recycling, Worland, 
347-2528.

	
Opportunities
DINNER special at 
Safari Club: Barbe-
que ribs, choice of 
potato, soup or salad. 
$14.99

CHIEF Executive Of-
ficer is open for Gott-
sche in Thermopolis. 
Providing physical 
and occupational 
therapy in the Big 
Horn Basin. For more 
information, contact 
Cheryl Shero at 307-
864-2146, to apply 
visit: www.gottsche.
org/employment or 
email cshero@gott-
sche.org.

WYOMING Pioneer 
Home is seeking a 
qualified individual 
to fill the position 
of Human Services 
Aid (CNA), HSHS04-
2024-01139-CNA- 
Thermopolis. Salary 
$18.14-18.90 hourly, 
with insurance and 
retirement benefits. 
If applicant meets el-
igibility requirements, 
there is a $2000.00 
hiring bonus for this 
position. Join our 
team to become part 
of the warm, wel-
coming community 
of WPH. This posi-
tion provides health-
care for the person-
al/physical needs, 
comfort and safety of 
the facility’s uniquely 
independent resi-
dents. Applicant will 
perform duties and 
tasks delegated by 
the charge RN and/
or nurse manager.
To apply, go online 
to http://agency.gov-
ernmentjobs.com/
wyoming. Open until 
filled. EEO/ADA Em-
ployer.

WANTED: Station 
clerk needed at Ther-
mopolis Petro & Tire. 
Contact the office for 
application and inter-
view, 215 South 6th 
St., 864-3886.

SOCIAL              MEDIA

MACK’S Market is 
now hiring two ca-
shiers and four over-
night freight crew. 
Apply online, macks-
marketwyo.com/em-
ployment or in person 
at 600 South 6th.  

T H E  T h e r m o p -
ol is -Hot  Spr ings 
Chamber of Com-
merce is looking to 
hire an Office Re-
source Specialist 
and/or Administrative 
Assistant. Stop by the 
Chamber, 220 Park 
Street to pick up an 
application and job 
description. 

HOT Springs Hotel is 
hiring housekeepers. 
Pick up an application 
at the front desk. 115 
E. Park.

Rentals
GRAND Storage, 
new storage units 
ready. 100 sq.ft. units 
for $75 per month. 
Call 921-2611.	

TWO bedroom apart-
ments for rent, $700/
month, recently re-
modeled, renter pays 
electric. Laundry fa-
cility on site. Call 
(307) 388-3289. Ask 
about our move in 
special. 	

STORAGE  un i ts 
available. River Stor-
age, located at 104 
Warren. Call (307) 
259-0683.	

STORAGE  un i ts ​
available now at K-Lo 
Storage located at 
811 1/2 S. 6th St. in 
Thermopolis (behind 
Pizza Hut). Units are 
10x15 with 5x7 door. 
Call (307) 234-2211.

CRYPTO:

Garage Sale

READ THE PUBLIC NOTICES 
FOR YOUR PROTECTION
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