
Classified
September 26, 2024  PAGE 13

RIDE with us! Join 
the Senior Center on 
Fri., Oct. 11 for dinner 
at the Worland Elks 
Lodge. We will leave 
the Senior Center at 
5:30 p.m. $5 for the 
ride.	 9/26                

Join us for dance 
class at the Senior 
Center. Fridays, 1 
p.m. - 3 p.m. Call the 
Senior Center for 
more information. 
864-2151.         9/26	

FARMERS Market is 
every Saturday from 
8 a.m. - noon, down-
town Thermopolis at 
5th and Broadway. 
Artisans, bakers, pro-
duce, meats, dairy. 
Contact Kim for more 
information. (405) 
443-7560.	 9/26

INDEPENDENT Re-
cord Deadlines: Le-
gals -Friday at 4 p.m., 
Display Ads-Monday 
at Noon, Classifieds 
-Monday at Noon, 
Obituaries-Monday 
at 5 p.m. Call us at 
864-2328, stop by 
431 Broadway. Email 
at ads@thermopir.
com	 tfc

PORTABLE Oxy-
gen Concentrator 
May Be Covered by 
Medicare! Reclaim 
independence and 
mobil i ty with the 
compact design and 
long-lasting battery 
of Inogen One. Free 
information kit! Call 
866-896-3528.	9/26

Pets
D’S Dog Shop. 1004 
Shoshoni. 864-3141. 
Call today for all 
your pup’s grooming 
needs.	 tfc

Services
DO you need old 
newspapers? Great 
for fire starters, pack-
ing, arts and crafts 
and gardening. Stop 
by the Independent 
Record office, 431 
Broadway, Mon.-
Thurs., 8:30 a.m. 
- 5 p.m. Newspaper 
bundles are free, first 
come, first served. 	

YOU can say a lot 
in 25 words! Reach 
thousands of readers 
with a single clas-
sified ad when it is 
placed in WYCAN 
(Wyoming Classified 
Ad Network). Sell, 
buy, promote your 
services - only $150 
for 25 words. Contact 
the Independent Re-
cord at 864-2328 for 
more information on 
placing a WYCAN ad 
in all Wyoming news-
papers across the 
state. Best statewide 
coverage around!		
	 tfc

I mow lawns all sum-
mer long. If you want 
to get your lawn done, 
give Ted a call at 
921-2710 for more 
information. I charge 
$30-$35 per job. In 
town only.  	 10/31

DONATE your car, 
truck, boat, RV and 
more to support our 
veterans! Schedule 
a fast, free vehicle 
pickup and receive 
a top tax deduction!  
Call Veteran Car Do-
nations at 1-855-703-
1906 today!	  9/26

Opportunities
MARK your calen-
dars! The Golden 
Age Club Community 
Soup Supper, Fri. 
Oct. 18, 4 p.m .- 6:30 
p.m. There will be a 
variety of soups, ap-
ple pie and ice cream. 
$10 suggested dona-
tion for each person. 
Proceeds benefit the 
HSC Senior Center 
Building Fund. Open 
to the public, every-
one welcome.	 9/26

SEARCH Wyoming 
Public Notices at: 
www.wyopublicnotic-
es.com. This online 
service is provided 
free by your local 
newspapers, includ-
ing the Thermopolis 
Independent Record. 
You’ll easily find all 
public notices printed 
in Wyoming commu-
nity newspapers on 
this statewide digi-
tal repository. Stay 
in the know about 
your government. 
Minutes, salaries, 
spending, bids, tax-
es, foreclosures, 
hearings, schools, 
assessments, bud-
gets, and much more! 
www.wyopublicnotic-
es.com.	 tfc

Personals  
WHEN you don’ t 
know where to turn 
because someone 
drinks too much, Al-
Anon Family Groups 
can help! Join us on 
Thursdays, 6 p.m., 
in the Community 
Church basement, 
located at 244 N. 6th 
Street. 	 8/1

A L C O H O L I C S 
Anonymous meeting 
schedule. We are 
here to help guide 
and support you. All 
meetings are held at 
the Water Treatment 
Cottage - 1020 S. 6th 
St.,  Wed., 7 p.m.-
open discussion; Fri., 
7 p.m.-closed book 
study; and Sun., 7 
p.m.,open discus-
sion. Closed book 
discussions are Sat., 
10 a.m., 141 Pioneer 
Home Dr., west end 
basement library.     	

THE content of any 
advertisement in this 
newspaper is the 
sole responsibility of 
the advertiser. The 
Independent Record 
does not endorse, 
encourage or pro-
mote the purchase 
or sale of any prod-
uct, service, compa-
ny or individual who 
advertises in the In-
dependent Record.		                                                        
tfc                     

NARCOTICS Anon-
ymous meetings are 
held every Tuesday 
and Saturday, 7 p.m., 
at the Water Treat-
ment Cottage, 1020 
S. 6th. Call 921-0880 
for information.	5/31

DO you like adven-
ture? Join the HSC 
Senior Center for 
the final mystery trip 
of the year on Wed., 
Oct. 9, $10 per per-
son for the ride and 
lunch is on you. Call 
the Senior Center to 
get signed up or to 
get more informa-
tion. 864-2151.

BE in the know. 86% 
of Wyoming Adults 
cite local newspa-
pers and their web-
sites, as their most 
trusted sources for 
public notices vs. 
government and re-
lated sources. Wy-
oming citizens can 
monitor the actions 
of local governments 
from hearings, min-
utes, salaries, bids, 
elections, zoning, 
foreclosures and 
so much more! You 
can search all public 
notices printed and 
posted statewide 
with Wyoming com-
munity newspapers, 
in one place, online, 
free at wyopublicno-
tices.com.	 tfc

NARCOTICS Anon-
ymous meetings are 
held every Tuesday 
and Saturday, 7 p.m., 
at the Water Treat-
ment Cottage, 1020 
S. 6th. Call 921-0880 
for information.	5/31

WYOMING Pioneer 
Home is seeking a 
qualified individual 
to fill the position 
of Human Services 
Aid (CNA), HSHS04- 
-2024-01139-CNA- 
Thermopolis. Salary 
$18.31 hourly, with 
excellent benefits. If 
applicant meets eli-
gibility requirements, 
there is a $2000.00 
hiring bonus for this 
position. Join our 
team to become part 
of the warm, welcom-
ing community of 
WPH. This position 
provides healthcare 
for the personal/phys-
ical needs, comfort 
and safety of the 
facility’s uniquely 
independent resi-
dents. Applicant will 
perform duties and 
tasks delegated by 
the charge RN and/
or nurse manager.
To apply, go online 
to http://agency.gov-
ernmentjobs.com/
wyoming. Open until 
filled. EEO/ADA Em-
ployer.                9/26

MACK’S Market is 
hiring two cashiers 
and four overnight 
freight crew. Apply 
online at macksmar-
ketwyo.com/employ-
ment or in person at 
600 South 6th Street. 
Stop by for more 
info.                      tfc

PINNACLE Bank, 
Thermopolis is now 
hiring a teller/new 
accounts representa-
tive. Responsibilities 
include developing 
customer relation-
ships, receive & pay 
money, maintain ac-
curate record keeping 
of deposits & with-
drawals, negotiable 
instruments, other 
bank transactions, 
opening new ac-
counts and other du-
ties as assigned. Prior 
banking experience 
is generally expect-
ed, cash handling 
and customer contact 
experience is a plus. 
Please apply on line 
at www.pinnbank.
com/careers. EOE.                

BIG Horn Rural Elec-
tric Company in Ba-
sin, Wyo., is seeking 
to fill the accountant 
position at the head-
quarters in Basin. 
The successful can-
didate must be able 
to perform a variety 
of accounting duties 
in accordance with 
generally accepted 
accounting princi-
ples. Duties will in-
clude, but not limited 
to: prepare timely 
financial statements 
and various other 
accounting statement 
& reports; follow inter-
nal controls; prepare 
journal entries; pro-
cess accounts pay-
ables/receivables; 
process payroll; pre-
pare reconciliations 
of necessary gener-
al ledger accounts; 
process work orders; 
maintain external 
contact with audit 
firm, banks, mem-
bers, and trade as-
sociations; and be a 
responsible decision 
maker contributing 
to the Cooperative’s 
mission and goals. 
The successful can-
didate will possess an 
Associate’s Degree 
in Accounting or re-
lated field, plus two 
years of experience 
or equivalent combi-
nation of education & 
experience. Pre-em-
ployment drug & 
physical test is re-
quired. Please submit 
a resume & applica-
tion to Heather Law-
rence, Office Admin-
istrator, at: Big Horn 
REA, PO Box 270, 
Basin, WY  82410.  
Phone 1-307-568-
2419 email heather@
bighornrea.com. Big 
Horn offers an excel-
lent NRECA benefits 
package including 
401k, and medical, 
dental, vision and 
life insurance. Salary 
dependent on expe-
rience.  Applications 
accepted until posi-
tion filled. Applica-
tions can be obtained 
at www.bighornrea.
com, under the em-
ployment application 
tab.

Garage Sale
GARAGE Sale, Fri., 
Sept. 27, 10 a.m. - 2 
p.m. and Sat., Sept. 
28, 10 a.m. - ?.  212 
Ramsey Lane. Lots of 
new things added.		
	 9/26

SAT., Sept. 28, 9 
a.m. - ?, 137 Clark 
St. Ammo - 25-35, 
45-70 bullets, brass 
polisher, ammo cans, 
holster and belt, new 
in box tire pump, 
knives, trailer sway 
bars, super sealer, 
professional jewelry 
buffer with every-
thing, Indian jewelry, 
Frigidaire 18 C.F. frost 
free upright. Lots of 
misc. Cash only.	

For Sale
CABIN Fever Live 
Auction in Worland! 
323 Bridge Ave. on 
Saturday Sept. 28 
at 9:30 a.m.! This 
sale has everything 
to supply the cab-
in of your dreams 
from a 1992 Ford 
Bronco to a Wonder 
Woman Taco Time 
Decorative Drinking 
Glass. You can count 
on furniture, tools, 
garage supplies, ve-
hicles, books, decor, 
glassware, kitchen-
ware and so much 
more! See www.face-
book.com/hangin-
toughauctioneers/ 
or www.hangintough.
net for full details!

JACUZZI Bath Re-
model can install a 
new, custom bath or 
shower in as little as 
one day. For a limited 
time, waving all in-
stallation costs! (Ad-
ditional terms apply. 
Subject to change 
and vary by dealer. 
(Offer ends 8/25/24.) 
Call 1-866-718-1194. 

HAZEL  n Pearls 
will be open the first 
Thursday, Friday and 
Saturday of every 
month, 10 a.m. - 5 
p.m.	 9/26

Vehicles
PAYING for unpre-
pared iron. Buying 
junk cars. Will pick up. 
Selling quality used 
cars and trucks. Call 
us today at Pete Smet 
Recycling, Worland, 
347-2528.	 tfc

Miscellaneous   	
INDEPENDENT Re-
cord Deadlines: Le-
gals -Friday at 4 p.m., 
Display Ads-Monday 
at Noon, Classifieds 
-Monday at Noon, 
Obituaries-Monday 
at 5 p.m. Call us at 
864-2328, stop by 
431 Broadway. Email 
at ads@thermopir.
com	 tfc

HOT Springs Hotel 
is hiring for the front 
desk. Stop by for an 
application, 115 E. 
Park St.            9/26

CAPTEL Client Tele-
phone Representa-
tive. See our website 
for company infor-
mation about what 
we do: www.captel.
net. New, improved 
base hourly wage 
rate plan plus gen-
erous performance 
incentives. Company 
sponsored health 
plan after 30 days for 
Full-time employees 
working 30 hours or 
more. Earned paid 
leave and holidays. 
Financially rewarding 
opportunity for those 
who enjoy talking 
to people and have 
strong conversation-
al skills. Full -time and 
Part-time positions 
are available immedi-
ately in our pleasant 
downtown Thermo-
polis office. Basic 
PC skills required. 
Hybrid and Remote 
telework positions 
from home are also 
available throughout 
the Big Horn Basin. 
For immediate con-
sideration, please 
send resume to em-
ployment@captel.
net to arrange for an 
interview. CAPTEL is 
an equal opportunity 
employer.            10/3

THE Safari Club is 
hiring a server. Appli-
cations can be picked 
up at the front desk. 
115 E. Park St.            

G.K. Construction is 
accepting applica-
tions for a Mechanic  
in the Thermopolis & 
Greybull area. Pre-
drug testing required. 
Benefit package in-
cludes 401K retire-
ment plan, health, 
dental, vision, life 
insurance, and va-
cation pay. For appli-
cation, contact: G.K. 
Construction Inc. 
Email, tiffany@gk-
const.com or website: 
gkconstructioninc.
com. 307-548-6155.      	

HOT Springs Hotel is 
hiring for housekeep-
ing. Stop by the front 
desk for an applica-
tion. 115 E. Park St.

JOIN our team. Look-
ing for team oriented 
care givers at Big 
Horn Enterprise. Vari-
ety of hours available. 
Start at $14/hour. 
Residential shifts re-
ceive 5% shift differ-
ential pay. Additional 
increase in wage 
after 3 months and 
1 year with a suc-
cessful evaluation. 
$500 signing bo-
nus with  successful 
background check. 
Stop by and pick up 
an application at 641 
Warren St., Thermo-
polis.        	 tfc  

THE Tepee Pools is 
accepting applica-
tions for a  lifeguard. 
Stop by for more in-
formation or to apply 
at 144 TePee Street, 
Hot Springs State 
Park.                     tfc                

 
Rentals  

GRAND Storage, 
new storage units 
ready Oct. 15. Re-
serve now. 100 sq. 
ft. units for $75 per 
month. Call 921-
2611.	 12/19

STORAGE  un i ts 
available. River Stor-
age, located at 104 
Warren. Call (307) 
259-0683 today for 
more information.	tfc

STORAGE  un i ts ​
available now at K-Lo 
Storage (previously 
Sage Storage) locat-
ed at 811 1/2 S. 6th 
St. in Thermopolis 
(behind Pizza Hut). 
Units are 10x15 with 
5x7 door. Call West-
ern Land Sales (307) 
234-2211 for more 
information.	 tfc
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